
Making Money Your Friend, Part II

I know, I said there wasn't going to be a part two. 

This is it!

It's not that I'd actually left anything out from part I. Rather that I 
noticed something a little later that will be of further help to you.

It's simply the answer to this question:

"What is the greatest obstacle to allowing your money to flow to 
you without restriction?"

I'll not leave you in suspension or play personality analysis games 
with you because the answer is exactly the same for everyone:

It's, HABIT!

The habit of living your life the way it's "always" been. 

The cause, or root, of this habit is the fear that if you change 
something, you might die! 

One aspect of your "life the way it's always been" is not having as  
much money as you'd like to. The habit structure, however, says, 
literally, "having more money in my life changes it and I could die 
from it. I won't let it happen then I'll be safe." 

So let this be a second exercise for you. Sit straight and still. 
Imagine money flowing through you in torrents. It's your money, 
yours to do with exactly as you will. 
Notice your feelings, especially those in your belly which react to 
this wealth experience. The fear is the one you want to work with. 
When you've found it, take it to you and look at it. Ask the fear 
seriously, how could having more money kill me? There will be 
answers and all of them will look pretty silly. By doing this self-



analysis you will bring the light of reason and truth to your habits 
and they will simply lose their power over your life.

It is only when your habits remain unconscious that they have the 
power to control your life. 

The fear that having what you've always wanted could kill simply 
because a lack you've always had is no longer there looks pretty 
ridiculous when you bring it to the light of day doesn't it? When 
you let it work in the darkness, however, it will try to kill you 
rather than let your life change for the better!

Which do you want? It's a free choice.

You'll either keep practicing the old habit or you'll practice 
changing it. There is no other option. It's a simple, exclusive, 
yes/no thing. 

If you didn't get part I or, good Heavens to Murgatroyd, you've lost 
it! The you can download it again free at:
http://www2.harmonyunited.com/web/lib-gb.html

There are some other nice things there as well. 

Have a nice life.

Warmest regards

Karma Singh
Harmony United Ltd
London, Munich & (soon) Ohio
23rd of October 2005
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